
Mireia Monras: I currently manage the
Immuno-Oncology research program, several
European proposals, and institutional
programs such as the Severo Ochoa
Excellence program. Since 2023, I have also
served as the Head of Management for the
Master in Health & Science Management, an
academic program co-organized by VHIO and
aimed at developing new Scientific Manager
profiles. My journey at VHIO began in 2020 as
a Project Manager Trainee. In 2021, I advanced
to the role of Scientific Manager within VHIO's
Scientific Management area. 
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Javier Gonzalo: I am a PMP® Certified Project
Manager with a Degree in Chemistry, a PhD in
Material Science, and an MSc in Project
Management. My scientific background,
developed during my PhD and Postdoctoral
research, focuses on the design and
development of miniaturized sensors using
micro and nanotechnology for food and
biomedical applications. Since 2015, I have
been managing European and International
research programs of several clinical groups
and was also involved in proposal preparation.
In 2024, I was appointed Head of Management
of Clinical Programs and Task Forces Unit.
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